
Public Health (Prohibition on Advertisement, Sponsorship and Restriction on Sale and 

Consumption in Public Places of Alcoholic Drinks) (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 

2021 

 

GN No. 166 of 2021 

Government Gazette of Mauritius No. 109 of 20 July 2021 

 

THE PUBLIC HEALTH ACT 

Regulations made by the Minister under section 193  

of the Public Health Act 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Public Health (Prohibition on Advertisement, 

Sponsorship and Restriction on Sale and Consumption in Public Places of Alcoholic 

Drinks) (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 2021. 

2. In these regulations — 

"principal regulations" means the Public Health (Prohibition on Advertisement, Sponsorship and 

Restriction on Sale and Consumption in Public Places of Alcoholic Drinks) Regulations 2008. 

3. Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is amended, in paragraph (2)(c), by deleting the words 

"21 years" and replacing them by the words "18 years". 

4. Regulation 5A of the principal regulations is amended by deleting the words "21 years" wherever 

they appear and replacing them by the words "18 years". 

5. These regulations shall come into operation on 20 July 2021.  

Made by the Minister on 20 July 2021. 

 

_______________ 


